FAUQUIER COUNTY GOVERNMENT AND PUBLIC SCHOOLS
PROCUREMENT DIVISION
320 Hospital Drive, Suite 23
Warrenton, Virginia 20186
Phone: (540) 428-8715 Fax: (540) 347-5753

NOTICE OF CONTRACT AWARD
1. DATE: July 23, 2009

2. COMMODITY NAME: Custodial, Personal Care , Institutional Clothing &
Linens, Fauquier County Adult Detention Center

3. CONTRACT NUMBER:  43-09bwc-A, B, C
4. SUPERCEDES: 47-04khc
5. CONTRACT PERIOD: August 1, 2009 through July 31, 2010

6. RENEWAL OPTIONS: Four (4) one-year renewals

7. CONTRACTOR(S): See Page 3 for Listing of Contractors
8. TERMS: Net 45 days
9. DELIVERY: As Scheduled/requested

10. FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Barbara Whitehurst, Sr. Buyer
PH (540) 428-8715

11.  NOTICE TO ALL FAUQUIER COUNTY GOVERNMENT AND PUBLIC SCHOOL
USING DEPARTMENTS: This contract is the result of a competitive bid program and its
use must follow the FCG&PS Procurement Policy/Procedures for the purchase of the
commodity listed herein. Please see the reverse side of this notice for further
instructions regarding this contract.

By:

Barbara Whitehurst
Senior Buyer
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INSTRUCTIONS

Orders: All FCG&PS Using Departments must order services listed by
issuing FCG&PS Purchase Orders per FCG&PS Procurement Procedures
Manual. An exception to this shall be the use of the pre-approved
utilities voucher by the Contract Administrator only. An extra copy of
the Procedures Manual can be obtained by calling Procurement at
(540) 428-8717 or 8720.

The applicable contract number, vendor number, estimated total dollar
amount (can be done as a “Not to exceed” estimated figure), contact
person with phone number, and billing/delivery address must be
shown on each purchase order for Finance & Contractor use.

Inspection on delivery and approval of contractor’s invoice is the
responsibility of the receiving using department.

Any complaint as to quality of goods or services, faulty or delinquent
delivery, or violation of contract provisions by contractor shall be
reported to FCG&PS Procurement for handling with the Contractor. All
complaints must be submitted in writing and can be forwarded to
Procurement via fax or courier.

Renewals: As stated on the face of this notice, there are four (4) one-
year renewals on this contract. The contract will be renewed by mutual
agreement of both parties, approximately sixty days prior to expiration
of the current contract term, with input and approval from FCG & PS
Using Departments.

Use of Contract by Other Political Jurisdictions: This clause is contained
in IFB#43-09bw, which became this contract. This contract may
therefore be extended to Northern Virginia, Metropolitan Washington
Council of Governments jurisdictions and other jurisdictions and
Political Subdivisions of the Commonwealth of Virginia with the
authorization of the Contractor. FCG&PS acts only as the “Contracting
Agent” for these jurisdictions and political subdivisions.
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Custodial, Personal Care, Institutional Clothing & Linens,
Fauquier County Adult Detention Center
Contract #43-09bwc A, B & C

VENDOR ORDER ADDRESS LIST

VENDOR

REFERENCE NO. VENDOR NO.
A 631165

B 632095

C 632491
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NAME/ADDRESS/CONTACT
PERSON

Abel Industries, Incorporated
16815 Interstate Drive
Dumfries, VA 22026

PH: 703-550-9446

FX: 703-385-0096

Contact: Vicky Lutman

Bob Barker Company

PO Box 429
Fuquay-Varina, NC 27526
PH: 800-334-9880

FX: 800-322-7537
Contact: Tina Morgan

General Sales of Virginia

P.O. Box 12726

Roanoke, VA 24028

PH: 800-365-5444 or 540-343-5756
FX: 540-343-5987

Contact: Stu Stephens



Custodial, Personal Care, Institutional Clothing & Linens,
Fauquier County Adult Detention Center
Contract #43-09bwc A, B & C

VENDOR | ITEM | DESCRIPTION CATALOG NO. UNIT
REF. NO. | NO. PRICE

C 1 Floor Sealer, 5 gallon NCL 0504-5 Enseel $44.00

C 2 Floor Stripper, 5 gallon NCL 1058-5 Bare Bones | $46.95

C 3 Floor Finish, 5 gallon NCL 0512-5 Perfection | $49.20

C 4 Stripping pad, black, 18”, 5 per case, CASE price Norton $ 17.50/cs

C 5 Stripping pad, white, 187, 5 per case, CASE price Norton $ 17.50/cs

C 6 Buffing pad, red, 18", 5 per case, CASE price Norton $ 17.50/cs

A 7 Broom, corn, 1” dia. Wood hndle, 60” long 12/case | ABCO BRMCORN1 $ 3.95/ea

A 8 Dust pan, black plastic R-Maid#2005 $ 3.95/ea

RCP2005CHA

A 9 Mop head, looped end, 24 oz. cotton, white ABCO MOPMMD1 $ 3.95/ea

A 10 Mop handle, 60 long ABCO HND JAN $5.95/ea

B 11 Mop bucket/wringer set BB, Continental # 6130 | $43.85/set

A 12 Brush, toilet bowl, 13” long polypropylene, 12/case | ABCO BSHBOWL $ 1.20/ea

C 13 Cleanser, powder, Oxygen bleach 21 oz. 24/case AJAX $19.50/cs

A 14 Fabric sheets, 160 sheets/box, 6 boxes/case P&G PGCB80168 $ 8.75/bx

A 15 Drain opener, non-acid, 32 0z., 12 QT/case NCL# 1760 CLNOPEN | $34.00/cs

A 16 Detergent, powdered laundry, 40 Ib. bucket BOLT DRYLNDRY40 $ 16.00/bkt

C 17 Towel, paper, perforated, white, 75 sheets/roll, 30 Cascade # 4074 $20.70/cs
rolls/case

C 18 Toilet paper, perforated, white, 4.5”X3.1”, 2 ply, Lagasse GEN-201 $29.75/cs
500 sheets/roll, 96 rolls/case

A 19 Glass cleaner, aerosol, 20 0z can, 12 cans/case Chemical Pckg. $ 22.20/cs

AERWNDW

C 20 Disinfectant aerosol spray 16.5 0z can, 12/case Chase #4104 $29.77/cs

B 21 Hand Sanitizer, instant anti-microbial 70% Bob Barker # AG46 $ 34.80/cs
isopropy! alcohol gel, 4 oz. bottle, 60/case

C 22 Wastebasket, 14 gt. rectangle, color: sand Rubbermaid #2541 $7.00/ea

B 23 Cooler, water, 5 gallon Rubbermaid # 68511 $ 34.75/ea

B 24 Beverage server, insulated, 2.5 gallon Cambro BBC# 250LCD | $100.80/ea

B 25 Beverage server, insulated, 5 gallon Cambro BBC#500LCD | $116.15/ea

26 : —white; 20" NO BID NO BID

B 27 Apron, cotton/polyester w/chest pencil pocket, Bob Barker # WDA4236 | $ 10.50/cs
337X36”, white, 12/case

B 28 Soap, bar, unwrapped face & body, 3 0z. 144/case Bob Barker #TU3 $ 28.80/cs

B 29 Shampoo, clear, 2 0z. 96/case Bob Barker #MS2 $ 20.40/cs

B 30 Deodorant, stick, alcohol-free, .5 oz, 144/case Bob Barker #FD-05 $ 28.44/cs

B 31 Sanitary napkins, individually wrapped, beltless Bob Barker #SN12 $ 30.40/cs
w/adhesive strip, 576/case

B 32 Toothpaste, fluoride, natural mint flavor, .85 oz. Bob Barker #FM85 $ 14.40/cs
plastic tube, 144/case

B 33 Razor, single blade w/safety cap, 1,000/case Bob Barker # X1000 $ 75.00/cs

B 34 Toothbrush, 40-tuft soft, color: ivory, individually Bob Barker #BB37 $ 6.75/cs
wrapped, 144/case

35 Hard-Santtizer-nstant-anti-rierobial £0% (duplicate of Item # 21)
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Custodial, Personal Care, Institutional Clothing & Linens,
Fauquier County Adult Detention Center

Contract #43-09bwc A, B & C

VENDOR | ITEM | DESCRIPTION CATALOG NO. UNIT
REF. NO. | NO. PRICE
B 36 T-shirt, taped crew neck 100% 4.6 oz. pre-shrunk cotton, white, Bob Barker # 683 $ 26.88/dz
extra long tail, w/2” black “TRUSTEE” lettering front & back ,
Size L
B 36 A | Same as Item 36, Size: XL Bob Barker # 683 $ 26.88/dz
B 36 B | Same as Item 36, Size: 2XL Bob Barker # 683 $ 28.20/dz
B 36 C | Same as Item 36, Size: 3XL Bob Barker # 683 $ 32.64/dz
B 37 Sweatshirt, hooded, 50-50 cotton/poly, crew neck pullover, cover- | BBC # SSNV (navy) $ 66.00/dz
seamed, ribbed cuffs and waistband, w/2” “TRUSTEE” lettering BBC # SSGY (gray) ($5.50/ea)
front & back, color: navy blue or ash gray, Size L
B 37 A | Same as Item 37, Size: XL ($ 5.50/ea) BBC # SSNV & SSGY | $66.00/dz
B 37B | Same as Item 37, Size: 2XL ($ 6.60/ea) BBC # SSNV & SSGY | $79.20/dz
B 37 C | Same as Item 37, Size: 3XL ($6.90/ea) BBC # SSNV & SSGY | $82.80/dz
B 38 Shirt, men’s, white 65/35 poly/cotton, 7.5 0z. min. weight, triple Bob Barker # TWS $ 4.40/ea
seam stitching w/heavy duty color-coded cotton-wrapped poly
thread, v-neck, dolman short sleeve w/breast pocket, sleeve and
shirt bottom hemmed. Black 2” lettering on back, “Fauquier Co.
ADC”. Size L
B 38 A | Same as Item 38, Size: XL Bob Barker # TWS $ 4.40/ea
B 38 B | Same as Item 38, Size: 2XL Bob Barker # TWS $ 4.50/ea
B 38 C | Same as Item 38, Size: 3XL Bob Barker # TWS $5.00/ea
B 39 Trouser, men’s, pull-on style, no pockets, elastic waistband Bob Barker # TBWT $5.10/ea
finished w/4 rows of expansion stitching, mock fly, hemmed
bottom, same material spec as Item 38, Size L
B 39 A | Same as Item 39, Size: XL Bob Barker # TBWT $5.10/ea
B 39 B | Same as Item 39, Size: 2XL Bob Barker # TBWT $5.10/ea
B 39 C | Same as Item 39, Size: 3XL Bob Barker # TBWT $5.30/ea
B 39D | Same as Item 39, Size: 4XL Bob Barker # TBWT $ 5.60/ea
B 40 Trousers, men’s, same as ltem 39 except: NAVY BLUE, Size M Bob Barker # TNT $ 4.90/ea
B 40 A | Same as Item 40, Size: L Bob Barker # TNT $5.20/ea
B 40 B | Same as Item 40, Size: XL Bob Barker # TNT $5.20/ea
B 40 C | Same as Item 40, Size: 2XL Bob Barker # TNT $5.30/ea
B 40D | Same as Item 40, Size: 3XL Bob Barker # TNT $5.30/ea
B 41 Trousers, men’s, same as Item 39 except: ORANGE, Size M Bob Barker # TOT $ 4.90/ea
B 41 A | Same as Item 41, Size: L Bob Barker # TOT $5.20/ea
B 41 B | Same as Item 41, Size: XL Bob Barker # TOT $5.20/ea
B 41 C | Same as Item 41, Size: 2XL Bob Barker # TOT $5.30/ea
B 41D | Same as Item 41, Size: 3XL Bob Barker # TOT $5.30/ea
B 42 Glove, cotton jersey, one size fits all, clute-style palms, knitted BBC# WGLC69 $5.49/dz
wrist, color: classic brown
B 43 Glove, work, leather palm, shirred elastic back, rubberized cuff BBC # 5049 $17.76/dz
B 44 Cap, 100% acrylic knit, machine washable, one size fits all, color: | BBC# 101N $9.60/dz
navy blue or orange
B 45 Boot, plain toe, suede leather, Goodyear welt construction, oil BBC # BB1050 $ 11.55/pr

resistant sole, Cambrelle insole w/10mm sponge, Cambrelle lining
w/5mm sponge. Cotton twill lined vamp, 5 pr. Stainless steel
eyelets, pull loop backstay, wood shank. 6” height, wide width,
soft collar. Color: brown. Sizes: 7- 12
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Custodial, Personal Care, Institutional Clothing & Linens,
Fauquier County Adult Detention Center
Contract #43-09bwc A, B & C

VENDOR | ITEM | DESCRIPTION CATALOG NO. UNIT
REF. NO. [ NO. PRICE
B 46 Boot, steel toe (withstand 2500 Ibs), Goodyear welt construction, BBC # 82221 $ 14.90/pr

oil resistant sole, Cambrelle insole w/10mm sponge, Cambrelle
lining w/5mm sponge. Cotton twill lined vamp, 5 pr. Stainless
steel eyelets, pull loop backstay, wood shank. 6” height, wide
width, soft color. Color: black. Sizes: Small — 2XL

B 47 Thong, v-strap (classic shower shoe), %2” thick black cushioned BBC # 1800 $7.20/dz
sole, ¥2” wide reinforced v-strap, 5/8” shaft between toe, %" thick
white cushion insole. Sizes: Small — 2XL

B 48 Blanket, 90% wool content, loom woven, flame resistant, machine | Bob Barker # $11.94/ea
washable, whip stitch around edges, 66”X90”, Color: dark green WB6690GR

B 49 Blanket, 100% cotton thermal, economy grade, machine BBC # EGTB $5.25/ea
washable/tumble dry, 66”X90”, Color: white

B 50 Pillow, lightweight, 100% polyester fiber flame resistant core, 1.4 | BBC # MVV2026 $ 18.16/cs

Ib weight, breathable flame-resistant multi-layer soft vinyl/nylon
laminate cover material, cleans w/soap/water, 20”X26", 4/case

B 51 Pillow cover, 3-ply vinyl, waterproof, double-stitch edges, flame BBC # VPC 2026 $4.20/ea
resistant, wipe clean w/soap/water, 20”X26”, Color: dark green
B 52 Mattress, Flame-Chek*, 5”/12 oz. densified poly core compressed | Bob Barker # PIM25754 | $ 26.94/ea

to 4” finished height, 25”X75”X4”. Color: dark green
*Passes DOC Fed. Flammability Std. FF-4-72, cigarette ignition
resistance standard (DFR1632, Calif. TB106)

B 53 Washcloth, 100% terry cotton, .75 Ib, 12”X12”, color: white BBC# WC1212 $1.62/dz
B 54 Shower curtain, hookless, opaque, snap closure, 8 oz. weight, BBC # SC3677 $9.48/ea
20ply vinyl, tear and flame resistant
B 55 Shower mat, white, suction-back, 21 5” X 21 ¥.” Bob Barker # SM 2121 $ 4.80/ea
56 ; ~white; “X20” (duplicate of ltem 26) NO BID NO BID
57 Apron-cotton/polyesterwichest pencil-pocket-33X36" - white; (duplicate of Item 27)
12/case
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